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ATTACHMENT "A"

BID # 1285/SUMMER BID COWBOY Logan County Longan Pryor Asphalt Robinson STATE
HOT MIX Asphalt GUTHRIE, OK Construction LOCATION Construction CONTRACT
/9/25 - 10/31/2025 918-845-1123 405-282-3711 918-786-2301 918-607-8720 918-649-0023 Sw0081
POTEAU, OK EACH
TYPE A HMViHL $62.50 $61.00 MONTH
64-22 STATE
TYPE B HMHL $67.50 $64.00 PRICE
64-22 CHANGES
TYFE C HVIHL $70.00 $66.00 SEE
64-22 _ CONTRACT
_ FOR
53 $62.50 564.00 $75.00 CURRENT
64-22 PRICE
54 $67.50 $65.00 578.00
64-22
55 $70.00 567.00 $82.00
64-22
DELIVERY PRICE PER 50.40 $0.38
$18.00 PT END
TON PER MILE $6.94 DUMP
PER HOUR $135.00
COLD PATCH QPR PROLINE BAGS COLD PATCH COLD PATCH COLD PATCH
PLANT $115.00 $125.00 $115.00 $128.00
DELIVERED $140.00 $150.00
BAGS 12.50 @ PLANT
15.50 DELIVERED
50 min

****ASPECIAL

NOTES****

DELIVERY to all

locations start

@56.50per ton for

the first PT=PER TON NEW VENDOR

5 miles, then add .30

per ton per mile

after PM= PER MILE
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ATTACHMENT "B"

ASPHALT PRODUCTS

~ COASTAL ENERGY

VANCE BROTHERS

WRIGHT ASPHALT

BID #1290 / SUMMER BID

WILLCW SPRINGS, MO

OKC

5 SULZER WAY, TULSA

5/5/2025-10/31/2025

417-468-2777

866-383-3711

417-343-7848

PRICES PER GALLCN

P-Uf DELIVERY

P-U/DELIVERY

P-U / DELIVERY

AE-P 2237095 2751289
CQS-1F 60% 2.02/2.05
MC-30 255259
MC-250 2.49/2.52
MC-800 DRTDR0
MC-3000 283012233
SS-1 2.06/2.09 2.35/2.49
CRS-2 1.87/1.92 2251239 B8 LE]
CRS2+ 2.01/2.04 2.50/2.64 2471219
CRS2S8-3% 2:183L7516 2.65/2.79 2.29/2.31
CHFS-2P-3% 225221 2.36/2.38
BC-1HT
CMS-1PF
CMS-1PC
PUMP CHARGE 125 125 100
DEMURRAGE 100 100 15

SHORT FREIGHT FEE

$800.00 LOADS LESS

THAN 5500GL 5500GL MIN LOAD |MIN LOAD 48.000 LBS

We request two free hours before demurrage begins.




BOOK 27 PAGE 300

MAYES COUNTY BiD RECORD

ETTACHMENT "C”
ROCK BID / ANNUAL BID APAC APAC PRYOR PRYOR
BID #1291 918-256-7853 FACTOR DISTANCE STONE STONE
6/9/2025-6/30/2026 918-825-3370 918-825-3370
'Low Bid / Availability OOLAGAH PLANT VINITA PLANT QUARRY ROCK CREEK
WASHED CHIPS 3/8" 13.15 13.15
1/2"
CLASS A 3/4" 12.85 12.85
| UNWASHED CHIP 3/8" k5 13.15
/2" 13.15
3/4" 12.85 12.85
T
11/2" 23S 12.35
>
CRUSHER RUN 1/2"
3/4" 11.50 11.50
D
11/2" 11.75 11.50
2-3" HE7 E1.75
LARGE 4"-6" 12.00 12.00
SCREENINGS 9.00 9.00
SHALE - SPECIAL MIX 1-1/2" TO 3" 8.75 10.00
MILL RUN 1-1/2" 8.95 10.00
WASTE MISC
RIP-RAP 20.00 20.00
PUG MAT PROCESS 595 SIS
SURGE / SHOT ROCK 2-8" 12.45 12.45
SAND 28.00 30.00
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MAYES COUNMTY BID RECORD

ATTACHIMERT "D"

CONCRETE BULLTUEF MUD CO EAGLE REDI-MIX | =
BID #1292 READY MIX LLC CONCRETE, LLC
6/9/2025-6/30/2026 918-458-9000 918-355-5700
Low Bid / Availability TAHLEQUAH, OK TULSA, OK
CLASS AA 171.00 164.00
PSI 4000 3/4ROCK
MIX CODE 63 PR3
PSI 4000@28DAYS 4000
CLASS A 166.00 158.00
PSI 3000 3/4 ROCK
MIX CODE 61 PR40
PSI 3000@28 DAYS 3000
CLASS B 161.00
PSI 3000 1.SROCK
MIX CODE 6
PSI £000@280AYS
CLASS C 156.00 154.00
PSI 2400
MIX CODE 60 PRO3
PSI ~ 2400@28DAYS 2400
STRAIGHT CONCRETE ADD (+) $8/YARD

WHEN FUEL IS $3.00 GALL

AND HIGHER FUEL
SURCHARGE WILL APPLY
DLEIVERY ADDITIONS MIN DELIVERY 6 YARDS 12.00 ICE PER #40
WATER HOT OR COLD 6.10 YARD 5.00 HOT
ACCELERATOR 5.00
PER 190
SEE ATTACHED FOR

MORE PRICING
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ATTACHMENT "E"

THE RAILROAD YARD

BiD # 1293 ANNUAL DP SUPPLY CO FENSCO INC FERGUSCN
HP STORM PIPE 018-266-0209 89i8-798-454¢ 9i8-505-6515
6/5/2025-6/30/2026

12" X 20' $ 5.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID
15" X 20' S 13.42

18" X 20' S 18.11

24" X 20' S 27.42

30" X 20' S 41.80

36" X 20' S 54.66

42" X 20' S 68.07

48" X 20' S 93.51

60" X 20' S 128.45
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MAYES COUMTY BID RECORD

ATTACHEMENWT "F"

TR e R SEMAIE BT DUB ROSS CO.. WILSON
ARCHED PIPE DUR ROSS CO,, INC. WILSON CULVERTS INC. ~ DUB ROSS CO., INC. WILSON CULVERTS INC. INC. CULVERTS INC.
BID #1204/ANNUAL |OKC, OK ELLCHART, TX
6/9/2025-6/30/2026 800-522-3790 003-764-5605
12 GAUGE 12 GAUGE 14 GAUGE 14 GAUGE 16 GAUGE 16 GAUGE

22/3"X 12" | 3tX 1" 22/3"X 1/2" St 223" X1 FEXES 22/3"X 172" Sheai 22/3"X 12" 22/3" X 1/2"
15" 17X13 19.85 23.31 16.02 19.45
18" 21X15 37.76 23,45 27.73 18.93 23.1
21" 24X18 43.67 27.05 32.20 21.76 26.76
24" 28X20 45.12 48.30 30.79 36.36 24.67 30.45
30" 35X24 53.72 60.20 37.95 45.37 30.46 37.89
36" 42X29 64.59 73.04 4522 54.13 36.46
42" 49X33 76.49 84.85 54.09 63.05
48" 57X38 86.00 118.65 115.70 73.69 86.12
54" 64X43 96.95 130.28 130.32 81.51 97.30
60" 7T1X47 110.90 142.40 142.47 89.87 105.75
66" 77X52 156.00 157.08 98.35 116.82
72" 83X57 171.65 171.71 [08.21 127.51

PIPE MUST CONFORM TO ODOT SPECS.
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MAYES COURNTY BID RECORD

ATTACHEMERNT "G"

ROUND PIPE /

DUB ROSS CO., INC.

DUB ROSS €O . INC.

DUB ROSS CO.. INC.

ANNUAL WILSON CULVERTS WILSON CULVERTS WILSON CULVERTS
BID #1295 12 GAUGE 12 GAUGE 14 GAUGE 14 GAUGE 16 GAUGE 16 GAUGE
6/9/25-6/30/2026 22/3"X 12" X1 22/3" X 172" SR.ae 223" X 12" 3"X1" 22/3" X 12" SUX 1 22/3" X 12" 3"X1" 22/3" X 1/2" il
12" 17.85 12.12 14.83
15" 18.80 22.31 15.02 18.45
18" 36.76 224} 26.73 17.93 22.10
21" 42.7¢ 26.05 31.20 20.76 25.76
24" 43.93 47.30 29.69 35.36 23.67 29.45
30" 52.16 59.20 36.95 44.37 2946 36.89
36" 62.71 72.04 44.22 53.13 35.26 44.63
42" 72.85 83.85 51.61 62.05 41.05 51.60
48" 83.50 113.00 114.20 68.55 84.62 55.06 70.89
54" 94.13 125.97 128.82 76.18 95.80 6181 79.73
60" 107.67 138.42 140.97 85.59 104.25 68.54 87.59
66" 153.0¢ 155.76 93.67 115.50 7529 95.70
72" 168.80 170.21 103.06 126.01 §2.04 105.06
78" 176.90 181.74 111.45 134.94 90.67
84" 178.00 196.10 119.90 145.78 97.50

PIPE MUST CONFORM TO ODOT SPECS.
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{4AYES COUNTY BID RECORD

ATTACHMENT "H"

NEW & USED PIPE / ANNUAL HIGHFILL RAILROAD SUNBELT CORE & MAIN Hillenburg
BID#1296 PIPE LLC YARD MEEKER, OK OWASSO, OK Pipe & Steel
6/9/25-6/30/26 918-341-0999 1-800-375-8763 405-279-3331 ‘ 918-586-7100
PRICED PER FOOT NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID
NEW - 3/8" OR MORE:
=
5
9" BID WAS
10" OVERNIGHTED 2990
12" FED EX 38.45
USED - 3/8" OR MORE: DID NOT COME
7" 6/2/2025
8" |
" |
10" 13
12"
USED:
8" X 3/16" 10.90
8" X 1/4" 14.90 |
10" X 3/16" 15.90 |
10" X 1/4" 21.00
12" X 3/16" 17.45
12" X 14" 17.45
14" X 1/4" 2430
16" X 1/4" 34.90
18" X 1/4" 42.95
20" X 1/4" 36.20
22" X 1/4" 38 80
24" X 1/4" 46 45
30" X 3/8" G4 .45
34" X 5/16"
36" X 5/16" 54 85
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MAYES COUNTY BID RECORD

ATTACHMENT "I"

16/9/2025-6/30/2026

S e %
BALLOTS MID-WEST PRINTING | ROVAL PRINTING CO.INC S
(EIRALI 800-375-3494 405-235-858]

| SAPULPA, OK OKC,0K e
REGULAR BALLOTS BW/CLR BW/CLR
MAX QUANTITY PER ELECTION .i
8.5X14.0 .15/.01 16/0
! 8.5X17.0 161,02 17/0 ;
B 8.5X19.0 16/.02 17/0 !
B
j ABSENTEE BALLOTS
| _MAX QUANTITY PER ELECTION
| 8.5X14.0 15401 .16/0
B 8.5X17.0 16/.02 17/0
] 8.5X19.0 16/.02 17/0 ;
N
SAMPLE BALLOTS 5
MAX QUANTITY PER ELECTION ) gl
8.5X14.0 15101 16/0 ?
| 8.5X17.0 16402 17/0
8.5X19.0 16/.02 17/0
20.00 CHARGE FOR LESS | 15.00 CHARGE FOR LESS
DELIVERY CHARGE THAN 200 THAN 200
E
2
!
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ATTACHMENT "J"

TRASH CONTAINER/ ANNUAL BID CARDS MJIM CONSTRUCTION | PRYOR WASTE
BID #1298 918-953-9401

6/2/2025-6/30/2026

Low Bid / Availability CHELSEA, OK INOLA, OK PRYOR, OK

30 YARD TRASH CONTAINER TO BE SET AT ANT LOCATION IN MAYES COUNTY
TRASH CONTAINER 5 325.00
COUNTY WIDE SPRING CLEAN UP § 325.00
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ATTACHEMENT "K"

Brent Bell Cowboy Asphalt Drill-Rite Inc. Eric & Sons Asphalt|  Stryker Asphalt
RID 1299/ASPHALT Construction Services
Brent Bell E. Pollard Franklin Keith Louis Mouse Shane McKnelly
LAYDOWN SERVICE Sanders
6/2/2025-10/31/2023 918-440-8436 018-843-1123 918-607-8720 918-323-2411 405-446-1011
NOWATA, OK TULSA, OK SALINA, OK
2" Overlay Per Ton $ 1000} % 125.00 { 7.00 $ 15.00
2 1/2" Overlay per Ton $ 9.75 1% 12500 | § 7.00 $ 14.00
3" Overlay Per Ton $ 950 | % 125.00 1 5 7.00 $ 13.00
PAVER PAVES 10'
TO 28 WIDEIN 1
PASS 100 TON MIN 500 TON MIN
{




